

IFB NO. 3068-18
LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS
EXHIBIT A - BID TAB SUMMARY FOR RATE INCREASE

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	CURRENT GALLS, LLC.				2020	
		BRAND	STYLE #	PRICE EACH		Unit Price Increase	Percent Increase
1	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	Horace Small	sr685	M/F	\$41.50	\$42.75	3.0%
2	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	Elbeco	sg909	M/F	\$50.00	\$51.50	3.0%
3	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	Elbeco	sg917	M/F	\$50.00	\$51.50	3.0%
4	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	Elbeco	sh885	M/F	\$39.25	\$40.43	3.0%
5	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	Fechheimer	sh020	M/F	\$33.00	\$34.02	3.1%
6	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	Fechheimer	sh1145	M/F	\$49.50	\$51.03	3.1%
7	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	Blauer	sh599	M/F	\$59.00	\$60.18	2.0%
7a	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS, size 2X and up	Blauer	sh599	M/F	\$62.50	\$63.75	2.0%
8	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	Galls	sm617	M/F	\$24.00	\$25.34	5.6%
9	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	Galls	st125	M/F	\$24.00	\$25.34	5.6%
10	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	5.11	sw993	M/F	\$32.00	\$32.00	0.0%
11	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	Propper	st136	M/F	\$29.25	\$29.25	0.0%
12	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	Galls	sw977	M/F	\$39.00	\$41.18	5.6%
13	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	Horace Small	zf129	M/F	\$47.25	\$48.67	3.0%
14	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	Elbeco	sg908	M/F	\$58.00	\$59.74	3.0%
15	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	Elbeco	sg916	M/F	\$58.00	\$59.74	3.0%
16	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	Elbeco	sh878	M/F	\$43.50	\$44.81	3.0%
17	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	Fechheimer	sh018	M/F	\$33.50	\$34.54	3.1%
18	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	Fechheimer	sh1498	M/F	\$49.00	\$50.52	3.1%
19	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	Blauer	sh445	M/F	\$61.50	\$62.73	2.0%
19a	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS, size 2X and up	Blauer	sh445	M/F	\$66.00	\$67.32	2.0%
20	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	Propper	sh240	M/F	\$30.00	\$30.00	0.0%
21	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	Fechheimer	sh1498	M/F	\$49.00	\$50.52	3.1%
22	TROUSERS	Horace Small	tr784	M/F	\$43.50	\$44.81	3.0%
23	TROUSER	Fechheimer	zb137	M/F	\$47.25	\$48.71	3.1%
24	TROUSER	Elbeco	tu610	M/F	\$44.00	\$45.32	3.0%

IFB NO. 3068-18
LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS
EXHIBIT A - BID TAB SUMMARY FOR RATE INCREASE

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	CURRENT GALLS, LLC.				2020	
		BRAND	STYLE #	PRICE EACH		Unit Price Increase	Percent Increase
25	TROUSER	Horace Small	tr052	M/F	\$56.00	\$57.68	3.0%
26	TROUSER	5.11	tr666	M/F	\$40.50	\$40.50	0.0%
27	TROUSER	5.11	tr703	M/F	\$40.50	\$40.50	0.0%
28	TROUSER	Blauer	tr768	M/F	\$59.00	\$59.00	0.0%
28a	TROUSER, size 44 and up	Blauer	tr768	M/F	\$66.00	\$66.00	0.0%
29	TROUSER	Fechheimer	zb137	M/F	\$47.25	\$48.71	3.1%
30	TROUSER	Propper	tr159	M/F	\$30.00	\$30.00	0.0%
31	TROUSER	Dickies	tu842	M/F	\$18.00	\$18.90	5.0%
32	BELT	5.11	np571	M/F	\$13.50	\$13.50	0.0%
33	TIE	Galls	va494	M/F	\$5.00	\$5.00	0.0%
34	JACKET	Blauer	jc594	M/F	\$219.50	\$221.70	1.0%
34a	JACKET, size 2X and up	Blauer	jc594	M/F	\$241.25	\$243.66	1.0%
35	JACKET	Gerber	ja775	M/F	\$140.00	\$140.00	0.0%
36	WINDBREAKER	Liberty	jc259	M/F	\$23.00	\$23.00	0.0%
37	RAINCOAT	Liberty	rw266	M/F	\$56.75	\$56.75	0.0%
38	RAINCOAT	Neese	rw092	M/F	\$18.00	\$18.00	0.0%
39	BOOTS	Bates	sp675	M/F	\$105.00	\$107.10	2.0%
40	COWBOY HAT (new item)	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	
41	NAME TAG	Galls	UA025N	M/F	\$7.00	\$7.39	5.6%