

IFB NO. 3060-17
LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS
DECEMBER 6, 2017 – 2:00 PM

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED NARDIS PUBLIC SAFETY				PROPOSED GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.			
		BRAND	STYLE #	PRICE EACH		BRAND	STYLE #	PRICE EACH	
1	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
2	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
3	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
4	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	Elbeco	Z9814LCN/Z 3314N	M/F	\$42.29
5	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
6	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
7	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	Blauer	867510/8675	M/F	\$49.90	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
8	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
9	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
10	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	5.11 Tactical	61165- 019/71049- 019	M/F	\$36.24
11	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
12	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	VERTX	VTX4010BKP/ VTX4000BKP	M/F	\$40.41
13	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
14	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
15	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
16	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	Elbeco	9314LCN/Z31 4N	M/F	\$46.68
17	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
18	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
19	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	Blauer	867000/8670	M/F	\$54.90	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
20	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
21	LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
22	TROUSERS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
23	TROUSER	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
24	TROUSER	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	Elbeco/w/o stripe	E9314LC/E31 4RN	M/F	\$41.87
24a	TROUSER	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	Elbeco/w stripe	E9314LC/E31 4RN	M/F	\$47.87
25	TROUSER	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
26	TROUSER	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
27	TROUSER	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
28	TROUSER	Blauer	865710/8657	M/F	\$54.90	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
29	TROUSER	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	Flying Cross	TRO70W/TRO 70	M/F	\$43.11
30	TROUSER	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	Propper	F520138001	M/F	\$26.79
31	TROUSER	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
32	BELT	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
33	TIE	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	Samual Broome	90028- 61/90001-61	M/F	\$3.78
34	JACKET	Blauer	9820	M/F	\$230.90	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
35	JACKET	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	Gerber Outerwear	71DX1/L	M/F	\$133.28
36	WINDBREAKER	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	Liberty Uniforms	560MNV	M/F	\$15.24
37	RAINCOAT	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
38	RAINCOAT	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
39	BOOTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
40	COWBOY HAT	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid
41	BOOTS	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	M/F	No Bid

DATE:

COMMISSIONERS COURT ACTION:

DATE DEPARTMENT NOTIFIED:

DATE BIDDER NOTIFIED: