

NUECES COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
 IFB 2930-13
 Motor Oil and Lubricants Comparison
 May 24, 2013 - 2:00 PM

Item #	Item Description	Package Size	Est Annual Usage	Oil Patch Petroleum, Inc.		Arguindegui Oil Co, II, Ltd.		Quality Standard Petroleum		Sun Coast Resources, Inc.		Lowest Bid Extended Cost
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
1	Motor oil 30 wt SAE (gasoline motor oil, SL rated, and multi-duty).	55 Gallon Drum	5	\$616.65	\$3,083.25	\$785.81	\$3,929.05	\$528.00	\$2,640.00	\$612.30	\$3,061.50	\$2,640.00
2	Motor oil 30 wt SAE (gasoline motor oil, SL rated, and multi-duty).	Quart Container	136	\$3.25	\$442.00	\$3.45	\$469.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.76	\$375.36	\$375.36
3	Motor oil 40 wt SAE (gasoline motor oil, SL rated, and multi-duty).	55 Gallon Drum	3	No Bid	No Bid	\$527.38	\$1,582.14	\$550.00	\$1,650.00	\$612.30	\$1,836.90	\$1,582.14
4	Motor oil 10W30SAE (gasoline motor oil, SL rated, and multi-duty).	Quart Container	144	\$3.25	\$468.00	\$2.96	\$426.24	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.76	\$397.44	\$397.44
5	Motor oil 10W30SAE (gasoline motor oil, SL rated, and multi-duty).	55 Gallon Drum	16	\$536.25	\$8,580.00	\$387.81	\$6,204.96	\$513.00	\$8,208.00	\$512.29	\$8,196.64	\$6,204.96
6	Motor oil 5W30SAE (gasoline motor oil, SL rated, and multi-duty).	Quart Container	48	\$3.29	\$157.92	\$2.96	\$142.08	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.76	\$132.48	\$132.48
7	Motor oil 5W30SAE (gasoline motor oil, SL rated, and multi-duty).	55 Gallon Drum	6	\$640.13	\$3,840.78	\$385.75	\$2,314.50	\$660.00	\$3,960.00	\$518.29	\$3,109.74	\$2,314.50
8	Motor oil 5W20SAE (gasoline motor oil, SL rated, and multi-duty).	55 Gallon Drum	12	\$550.00	\$6,600.00	\$399.50	\$4,794.00	\$516.00	\$6,192.00	\$518.29	\$6,219.48	\$4,794.00
9	Motor oil 5W20SAE (gasoline motor oil, SL rated, and multi-duty).	Quart Container	72	\$3.29	\$236.88	\$2.96	\$213.12	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.76	\$198.72	\$198.72
10	Motor oil 15W40SAE (H.D. Diesel Motor Oil, C1 4 Rated, oil to meet the API classification. Must meet or exceed the engine performance requirements for Cat, Cummins, Mack and Detroit Diesel 2 and 4 cycle engines).	55 Gallon Drum	35	\$695.06	\$24,327.10	\$429.06	\$15,017.10	\$570.00	\$19,950.00	\$495.00	\$17,325.00	\$15,017.10
11	Motor oil 30 wt, (non-detergent).	Quart Container	48	\$2.44	\$117.12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.02	\$96.96	\$96.96
12	Gear oil 80W90 wt (GL5 Rated, as required for use in transmissions and differentials).	35# Container	10	\$65.25	\$652.50	\$59.41	\$594.10	\$52.00	\$520.00	\$54.25	\$542.50	\$520.00
13	Gear oil 85W140 wt (GL5 Rated, as required for use in transmissions and differentials).	35# Container	10	\$66.31	\$663.10	\$59.41	\$594.10	\$52.00	\$520.00	\$54.25	\$542.50	\$520.00
14	Hydraulic oil (to be anti-wear-46, meeting ISO Grading and Vickers Vane Pump Testing-M2950S and I286-S and HF-2 approved).	55 Gallon Drum	42	\$485.25	\$20,380.50	\$447.63	\$18,800.46	\$448.00	\$18,816.00	\$440.55	\$18,503.10	\$18,503.10
15a	Transmission fluid (to meet AFT-Dextron VI approved).	Quart Container	174	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.07	\$534.18	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.88	\$849.12	\$534.18
15b	Transmission fluid (to meet AFT- Mercon V approved).	Quart Container	24	\$4.15	\$99.60	\$4.63	\$111.12	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.89	\$93.36	\$93.36
16	Transmission fluid (to meet AFT-Dextron VI, Mercon V approved).	55 Gallon Drum	31	\$796.48	\$24,690.88	\$488.88	\$15,155.28	\$495.00	\$15,345.00	\$815.65	\$25,285.15	\$15,155.28
17	Brake fluid (Dot 3 type).	1 Gallon Container	30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.57	\$377.10	\$377.10
18	Brake fluid (Dot 3 type).	Quart Container	60	\$3.84	\$230.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.18	\$70.80	\$70.80
19	Antifreeze (Auto extended life, no 50/50, Anti-Freeze Universal, must meet specifications for OEM, including Dex-Cool).	1 Gallon Container	140	\$11.27	\$1,577.80	\$10.94	\$1,531.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.41	\$1,317.40	\$1,317.40
20	Antifreeze – Universal ASTM 3306 & D4985 (Auto extended life, no 50/50, Anti-Freeze Universal, must meet specifications for OEM, including Dex-Cool).	55 Gallon Drum	8	\$601.89	\$4,815.12	\$284.69	\$2,277.52	No Bid	No Bid	\$417.45	\$3,339.60	\$2,277.52
21	Multipurpose Premium EP Grease (to be NLG1 #2 temperature range 350°).	14 Oz. Tubes	650	\$2.77	\$1,800.50	\$2.07	\$1,345.50	\$4.00	\$2,600.00	\$1.75	\$1,137.50	\$1,137.50
22	Kerosene (deodorized).	55 Gallon Drum	5	\$256.10	\$1,280.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$252.45	\$1,262.25	\$1,262.25
23	Windshield washer solvent.	1 Gallon Container	370	\$2.15	\$795.50	\$2.50	\$925.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.44	\$532.80	\$532.80
24	Oil dry, clay type.	50# Bags	470	\$5.23	\$2,458.10	\$7.50	\$3,525.00	\$8.00	\$3,760.00	\$3.70	\$1,739.00	\$1,739.00

25	Brake parts cleaner.	16 Oz Can	150	\$3.74	\$561.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.97	\$445.50	\$445.50
26	2 cycle engine oil.	2.6 Oz Bottle	200	\$4.14	\$828.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.32	\$64.00	\$64.00
27	Chainsaw Blade oil.	1 Gallon Container	24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.90	\$861.60	\$861.60
28	Grease EP 2 Lithium.	120# Cans	5	\$258.60	\$1,293.00	\$268.20	\$1,341.00	\$342.00	\$1,710.00	\$225.60	\$1,128.00	\$1,128.00
29	Tractor Hydraulic fluid.	55 Gallon Drum	14	\$489.50	\$6,853.00	\$380.94	\$5,333.16	\$524.00	\$7,336.00	\$530.20	\$7,422.80	\$5,333.16
30	Other Products – Percentage discount off manufacturer's list price			None		5%		None		None		

All, None or Split Award:
Bid Response Form:

Split
Y

Split
Y

Split
Y

Split
Y

Estimated Annual Cost: \$85,626.21